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We continue our cycle of monthly messages for 2025 with the message for 
September 1, 2009 for our prayer groups and personal reflection. 

September 1, 2009 
  
Jesus 
  
Dear apostles, I remind you to ask Heaven for the graces you require. In order 
to work in my plan, united to my will, you must be in the habit of asking for 
all that you need. This constant petitioning for help in your service creates in 
you an awareness of the unity within which you serve. In this way, you will 
begin to understand that nothing can be attributed to you except your 
willingness to serve. 
  
You will receive the graces you require, of course, and with these graces will 
come humility, because you will acquire an understanding of the relationship 
between your requests and Heaven’s answers. If Heaven is supplying you with 
all that you need to complete the tasks Heaven has assigned to you, then you 
cannot take credit for what is being accomplished. You may say that you are 
already doing this. I respond that I want you to increase both your dependence 
on Heaven and your awareness of your dependence on Heaven. Each day, 
every day, ask Heaven for help throughout the day. 
  
My beloved apostles, I am preparing you for a new time which will bring you 
joy because you will serve peacefully in complete trust. Why would a child 
fret when his Father sees to his every need? Truly, you are united to Heaven. 
I seek only to instill in you a greater awareness of our unity. I, Jesus, call on 
you for dedication and sacrifice, it is true, but not without cause and not 
without benefit. See to my interests in your day, please. In turn, I will protect 
your intentions. Spread joy and goodness. Spread unity and peace. Spread trust 
in God who will never abandon his children. 


